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Product Information  

Anti-Raf-1/c-Raf antibody, Mouse monoclonal 
clone RNP1, purified from hybridoma cell culture  

R2404

 

Product Description 

Monoclonal Anti-Raf-1/c-Raf (mouse IgG1 isotype) is 
derived from the RNP1 hybridoma produced by the 
fusion of mouse myeloma cells (NS1) and splenocytes 

from BALB/c mice immunized with a synthetic peptide 
corresponding to amino acids 334-345 of human  
Raf-1. The isotype is determined by a double diffusion 
immunoassay using Mouse Monoclonal Antibody 

Isotyping Reagents, Catalog Number ISO2.  

Monoclonal Anti-Raf-1/c-Raf recognizes human, rat 
and mouse Raf-1 (~75 kDa). The antibody may also 
detect Raf-1 degradation products as additional 
weaker bands at ~50 kDa. The product is useful in 
ELISA, immunoblotting, immunoprecipitation and 
immunocytochemistry. 

Raf-1 (c-Raf-1), a cytoplasmic serine/threonine 
protein kinase (73-76 kDa). It belongs to a small 
family of protein kinases that have been identified as 

central in signal transduction pathways.1-3 Raf-1 is the 
prototype member of this family that includes Raf-A 
and Raf-B, and is the cellular homolog of the viral 
oncogene v-Raf. Raf-1 is widely expressed in many 

tissues, whereas Raf-A and Raf-B are expressed 
mainly in urogenital and brain tissues, respectively4 
Raf-1 functions in the control of cell growth and 
differentiation, and its oncogenic form can initiate 
malignant transformation of cells. Raf-1 has a critical 
role in the Ras/MAP kinase signaling pathway, 
integrating mitogenic signals in mammalian cells from 

many growth factors, cytokines and oncogenes, e.g., 
EGF, PDGF, insulin, IL-2, IL-3, CSF-1, and GM-CSF. 
Raf-1 contains three regions that are highly conserved 
among Raf proteins, namely CR1, CR2, and CR3. CR1 
is rich in cysteine residues and contains two Ras 

binding domains, CRD and RBD.CR2 is rich in 

serine/threonine residues and CR3 is located within 
the C-terminal region of Raf-1 and constitutes the 
protein kinase domain. The regulation of Raf-1 
activity is a highly complex, multistep process whose 
regulatory events are not fully understood. Inactive 
Raf-1 is found in the cytosol, and is constitutively 
associated with the chaperones Hsp90, p50, and the 

14-3-3 protein.5, 6 

Upon mitogenic stimulation, Raf-1 directly interacts 
with Ras-GTP.7 This interaction with activated Ras 
localizes Raf-1 to the plasma membrane and is the 
first step in its activation. Raf-1 activity is regulated 
by autophosphorylation at threonine residues and by 
phosphorylation at multiple serine and tyrosine 

residues by a number of protein kinases, including 
PKC, Src and JAK2. Raf-1 regulates the MAP kinase 
pathway by phosphorylating and activating the 
downstream MAP kinase kinase, MEK.8-10 

Reagent 

Supplied as a solution in 0.01 M phosphate buffered 
saline, pH 7.4, containing 15 mM sodium azide as a 
preservative. 
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Antibody concentration: ~2.0 mg/mL 

Precautions and Disclaimer 

This product is for R&D use only. Not for drug, 
household, or other uses. Please consult the Safety 
Data Sheet for information regarding hazards and 
safe handling practices. 

Storage/Stability 

For continuous use, store at 2-8 °C for up to one 
month. For extended storage, freeze in working 
aliquots. Repeated freezing and thawing, or storage in 

"frost-free" freezers, is not recommended. If slight 
turbidity occurs upon prolonged storage, clarify the 
solution by centrifugation before use. Working dilution 

samples should be discarded if not used within  
12 hours. 

Product Profile 

Immunoblotting: a working antibody concentration of 
2.0-4.0 µg/mL is determined using extracts of A431 
cell line (human epidermoid carcinoma). 

 

Note: In order to obtain best results in different 

techniques and preparations we recommend 
determining optimal working concentration by 
titration test. 

References 

1. Rapp, U.R., et al., Oncogene, 6, 495-500 (1991). 

2. Avruch, J., et al., Trends Biochem. Sci., 19, 279-
283 (1994). 

3. Morrison, D.K., et al., Curr. Opin. Cell Biol., 9, 
174-179 (1997). 

4. Storm, S.M., et al., Oncogene, 5, 345-351 
(1990). 

5. Stancato, L.F., et al., J. Biol. Chem., 268, 21711-
21716 (1993). 

6. Haian, F., Science, 266, 126-129 (1994). 

7. Stokoe, D., et al., Science, 264, 1463-1467 
(1994). 

8. Kyriakis, J.M., et al., Nature, 358, 417-421 
(1992). 

9. Alavi, A., et al., Science, 301, 94-96 (2003). 

10. Dhillon, A.S., et al., EMBO J., 21, 64-71 (2002). 

Notice 

We provide information and advice to our customers 
on application technologies and regulatory matters to 
the best of our knowledge and ability, but without 
obligation or liability. Existing laws and regulations 
are to be observed in all cases by our customers. This 

also applies in respect to any rights of third parties. 
Our information and advice do not relieve our 
customers of their own responsibility for checking the 
suitability of our products for the envisaged purpose. 

The information in this document is subject to change 
without notice and should not be construed as a 
commitment by the manufacturing or selling entity, or 

an affiliate. We assume no responsibility for any 

errors that may appear in this document. 

Technical Assistance 

Visit the tech service page at 
SigmaAldrich.com/techservice. 

Standard Warranty 

The applicable warranty for the products listed in this 
publication may be found at SigmaAldrich.com/terms. 

Contact Information 

For the location of the office nearest you, go to 

SigmaAldrich.com/offices. 


